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President resigns
at Concordia College
The Rev. Roland A.

Frantz has resigned as
president of Concordia Col
lege.

His resignation, given to

R. A. Frantz

the college's board of con
trol. becomes effective.
June 30, 1975. Pastor
Frantz, now on a year's
eabbatical leave, will have
been president for 15 years
on that date, according to
Concordia.

Pastor Frsuitz intends to

remain on the Concordia

College faculty as a profes
sor of religion.

Concordia College, oper
ated by the Lutheran
Church — Missouri Synod,
in 1968, was grjuited a first-
year affiliation with the
University of Alberta.
During Pastor Frantz's

term as president enrol
ment more than doubled.
During the current term
there are 226 students, 66 in
the college and 160 in the
high school.
Dr. Alfred R. Roth, aca

demic dean at Concordia
for the past six years, has
been appointed acting pres
ident.


